CAMPBELL COUNTY UTILITIES AND SERVICE AUTHORITY
20644 TIMBERLAKE ROAD
LYNCHBURG, VA 24502
TELEPHONE (434)239-8654
FAX (434)237-5820
WATER TREATMENT PLANT CHEMICAL BID RESULTS Present Michael Templeton Water Operations Manager

Josh Pribble Field Operatons Director

January 30, 2026 TIME 14:00
Bidders
C H E M ICALS Jones Chemicals Shannon Chemical Brenntag Univar
CAUSTIC SODA /DT $931 /DT No Bid $799 /DT $820 /DT
SODIUM SILICOFLURIDE /LB No Bid No Bid $1.647 $1.41LB
CARBON /LB No Bid No Bid $1.28 LB $1.73LB
CHLORINE / TON $1.375LB No Bid No Bid No Bid
COPPER SULFATE / LB No Bid No Bid $2.88 LB $2.87 LB
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE / LB No Bid No Bid $4.99 Gal $4.65 Gal
SODA ASH /LB No Bid No Bid $.469 LB $.49LB
SODIUM PERMANGANATE No Bid $1.34 LB $1.50LB $1.27 LB
SULFUR DIOXIDE $1.7666 No Bid $1.48LB No Bid
CHLORINE / 150# CYL $2.00 No Bid $1.53 LB No Bid
INSURANCE (CONDITION #3) Yes Yes Yes Yes
CL2 SAFETY TRAINING (CON #6) Yes N/A N/A N/A




CAMPBELL COUNTY UTILITIES AND SERVICE AUTHORITY
20644 TIMBERLAKE ROAD
LYNCHBURG, VA 24502
TELEPHONE (434)239-8654
FAX (434)237-5820

WATER TREATMENT PLANT CHEMICAL BID RESULTS Present Michael Templeton Water Operations Manager
Josh Pribble Field Operatons Director
January 30, 2026 14:00
Bidders
C H E M ICALS Control Equipmenmt
CAUSTIC SODA /DT No Bid
SODIUM SILICOFLURIDE /LB No Bid
CARBON /LB No Bid
CHLORINE / TON No Bid
COPPER SULFATE / LB No Bid
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE / LB No Bid
SODA ASH /LB No Bid
SODIUM PERMANGANATE $1.366
SULFUR DIOXIDE No Bid
CHLORINE / 150# CYL No Bid
INSURANCE (CONDITION #3) Yes
CL2 SAFETY TRAINING (CoN #6)| N/A




